
Silk Croft, Horton Crescent, Epsom



Offers In Excess Of

£375,000

• Top floor purpose built apartment

• Two spacious double bedrooms

• 28ft x 13ft triple aspect living/dining room

• Generous kitchen/breakfast room

• Ensuite shower room & bathroom

• Allocated parking bay & visitors bays

• Southerly facing balcony with views

• Wonderful elevated outlook over parkland

• Walking Distance to Epsom & West Ewell Stations

• Offered with the added benefit of no onward

chain

Leasehold

The Personal Agent are pleased to present this spacious, two
double bedroom top floor apartment that is located in arguably
one of the best positions within this attractive, and much
requested purpose built block with stunning elevated views over
parkland. 

Set in the heart of the highly sought after Livingstone Park, and
enjoying a private Southerly facing balcony and the secluded
parkland communal grounds that surround it, immediate
viewing is essential.

The 28ft x 13ft triple aspect living room is a real feature of this
property with a tremendous amount of natural light, all helped
by the French doors opening to the private balcony.

Just a stones' throw from the bus stop and a short walk from the
open spaces of Horton Country Park and the David Lloyd leisure
centre. Due to the high level of interest that we expect in this
property we are recommending immediate inspection.

Offering 979 Sq. Ft of accommodation, the apartment provides

a huge amount of flexible space and is perfect for those buyers
wanting well balanced and bright accommodation. 

The impressive 28ft triple aspect reception room has direct
access to the private balcony, there is a well proportioned
kitchen/breakfast room, main bedroom with ensuite shower
room and fitted wardrobes, a spacious guest bedroom and the
main bathroom. 

Further noteworthy points to note include allocated parking bay
with further visitors parking spaces available, security entry
system and the added benefit of no onward chain.

Such is the rarity of these top floor apartments in Silk Croft
becoming available we are advising all applicants to lodge their
interest as the allocation of well proportioned accommodation is
unrivalled in our view.

Livingstone Park is a quiet and well regarded residential
development, ideally located for Southfield Park primary school
and on the doorstep of Horton Golf Club and Horton Country

park, which provides enjoyable walks/bike rides in a tranquil
setting. 

Equally convenient for Epsom Common and Epsom town centre
offering a wide range of facilities including shops, bars &
restaurants, cinema & theatre and close to popular schools.
There are excellent transport links with Epsom railway station
which provides regular trains to London Waterloo, Victoria &
London Bridge. The M25 Junction 9 is about 3 miles drive away
with access to both Heathrow and Gatwick airports.

Tenure - Leasehold
Length of lease (years remaining) - 104 (125 Years from 2004)
Annual ground rent amount (£) - Approximately 200.00
Annual service charge amount (£) - Approximately 2000.00
Council tax band - D

PLEASE NOTE: Whilst we believe the information above to be
correct, we are unable to guarantee this information until such
time as we have formally verified it with the sellers. Therefore
you are advised to clarify any information with your chosen legal
representative before proceeding with the purchase of this
property.










